BID PROPOSAL FORM
Town of Washington Highway Department & Village of Millbrook Highway Department
2018-2019 Highway Materials Bid Specifications
Bidder agrees to provide the materials indicated below at the prices set forth below, in the quantities
requested from time to time by the Highway Superintendent for Highway Department purposes.
Materials requested will be provided upon request by the Highway Superintendent. The Town is not
obligated to purchase any given quantity of materials or services from the successful bidder. 8idder may
submit a proposal for one or more of the types of items listed.

BIDDER INFORMATION

Contact Name

Patrick Whiteley, Plant Manager

Cempany Name

Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.

Mailing Address

27 Commerce Street

City, State, Zip

Poughkeepsie, N.Y.

12603

Email Address

route82sand@verizon.net

Phone Number

Millbrook Plant: 845-266-3433 / Fax Number 845-266-4693

Item Description Unit FOB Delivered Plant
Price Price Location
Sail Top Soil Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 1A (34) Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 1st (3/8) Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 2 {3/4) Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 1 & 2 Mixed (3/8 & Ton
3/4)
Crushed Stone | No.3 (1 %) Ton
Crushed Stone | Screenings (Stone Ton
Dust)
Crushed Stone | Screenfill {1” Minus) Ton
Crushed Stone | Rip Rap Ton




Crushed Stone | %" tem 4 Ton

Crushed Stone | Medium to Heavy Ton
Stone

Crushed Stone | Gabion/Light Stone Ton
Fill/ Fine Stone Fill

Crushed Stone | Surge Stone (8” Ton
Minus)

Gravel Washed Grave!l Stone | Ton $16.25 $21.25 17 Cance Hill Road
#3(1%) Millbrook, NY

Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton $16.25 §21.25 17 Canoe Hill Road |,
#2 (3/4) Millbrook, NY

Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton $15.75 $20.75 17 Canoe Hill Road |
#1(3 /8} Millbrook, NY

Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton $15.25 $20.25 17 Canoe Hill Road |
# 1A (1/4) Millbrook, NY

Gravel Commercial Item 4 Ton $17.25 $22.25 17 Canoc Hill Road |

Millbrook, NY
Gravel Bank Run Gravel Ton $17.00 $22.00 17 Canoe Hill Road |
Miilbrook, NY

Gravel Cobbles (Tailings) Ton

Gravel Ice Control Sand Ton $16.00 $21.00 17 Canoe Hill Road
(Washed) Millbrook, NY

Calcium Liguid Calcium Gallon

Bituminous Hot Ton

Mix

Bituminous Cold Ton

Mix

Sand Mix Hot Ton

Cold Patch Bag 60 1b.

Bituminous CRS-2 Gailon Haul, Heat &

Mix Applied

Bituminous Ccms-2 Haul, Heat &

Mix Applied

Bituminous CRS-2 with 3% Haul, Heat &

Mix Polymer Applied




Equipment Rental Rates Based on an 8 Hour Day:

Self-Propelled CHP Spreader with Operator

Cold Mix Paver with Operator & Screener

Rubber Tired Roller with operator

Steel Wheeled Rolter with operator

Transportation

Fuel Oils and Unleaded Gasoline:
Price shall be net per gallon. Contract price will be firm except that price revisions will be allowed in
accordance with the following procedures:
. All deliveries will be metered.
Bidders will base their price on the average daily New York Harbor tank consumer
posting, as published daily in the Journal of Commerce, under petroleum prices.
. Bidders shall submit a copy of the posted price with the bid.
The successful bidder, at the time of billing, shall show proper cause of escalation or
de-escalation of prices as they occur.

Notice shall include the date of change, current price, change per gallon and new

price.
FUEL OILS AND UNLEADED GASOLINE
Description Unit Delivered price over New York Harbor JOC Posting
#2 Fuel Heating Oil Gallon
Unleaded Gasoline Gallon

Ultra-low Sulfur Truck | Gallon
Fuel {(Diesel)

All bids are due on or before 12 noon on Wednesday, October 10, 2018.

NAME OF COMPANY: Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.

Signature of Authorized Officer: R“M ),

Title of Authorized Officer: Stewart D. Petrovits, Secretary & Treasurer

Date: October 9, 2018




Statement of Non-Collusion in Bids or Proposals [General Municipal Law §103-d)

By submission of this bid, each Bidder/Proposer and each person signing on behalf of any
Bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint bid, each party thereto certifies as to its own
organization, under penalty of perjury, that to the best of their knowledge and belief:

1. The prices in this bid have been arrived at independently without collusion,
consuitation, communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting

competition, as to any matter relating to such prices with any other

Bidder/Proposer or with any competitor;

2. Unless otherwise required by law, the prices which have been quoted in the bid
have not been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer and will not knowingly be
disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer prior to opening directly or indirectly to any other
Bidder/Proposer or to any competitor; and

3. No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder/Proposer to induce
any other person, partnership or corporation to submit or not to submit a bid for the
purpose of restricting competition.

No bid/proposal will be considered for award nor shall any award be made where
paragraphs 1, 2, and 3 above have not been complied with; provided however, that if in
any case the bidder/proposer cannot make the foregoing certification, the
bidder/proposer shall so state and shall furnish with the bid/proposal a signed statement
which sets forth in detail the reasons therefor.

Where paragraphs 1, 2 and 3 above have not been complied with, the bid/proposal shall not be
considered for award nor shall any award be made unless the Town determines that such
disclosure was not made for the purpose of restricting competition.

The fact that a Bidder/Proposer: a) has published price lists, rates, or tariffs covering
items being procured, b) has informed prospective customers of proposed or pending
publication of new or revised price lists for such items, or ¢} has sold the same items to
other customers at the same prices being bid/proposed does not constitute, without
more, a disclosure hereunder.

|, Stewart D. Petrovits, Sec. & Treasurer __hereby affirm under penalty of perjury under
the Laws of the State of New York that | am authorized to provide this certification and

that the above is true and correct.
Route 82 Sand & Gravel, Inc.

Name of Entit
ij"-‘— b October 9, 2018

Agent Signature Date




obligated to purchase any given quantity of materials or services from the successful bidder. Bidder may

BID PROPOSAL FORM
Town of Washington Highway Department & Village of Millbrook Highway Department
2018-2019 Highway Materials Bid Specifications
Bidder agrees to provide the materials indicated below at the prices set forth below, in the guantities

requested from time to time by the Highway Superintendent for Highway Department purposes.
Materials requested will be provided upon request by the Highway Superintendent. The Town is not

submit a proposal for ene or more of the types of items listed.

BIDDER INFORMATION

Contact Name

/yf/éd’ ”/o /7/

Company Name

Mailing Address

9. B

dog

?QC!CF}8§ FA\/::"m,:JT’Co./ T e

City, State, Zip

5—roamdr”£ , l\”f fesgz.

Email Address

Phone Number

£alss é‘?r-) otr-)gsjoﬁ\/.,—?m:'—_,vk—l“. e

CzZ\- z2zY
Item Description Unit FOB Delivered Plant
Price Price Location
Soil Top Soil Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 1A {%4) Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 1st (3/8) Ton
acy———
Crushed Stone | No. 2 {2/4) Ton
e
Crushed Stone | No. 1 & 2 Mixed (3/8 & | Ton
3/4)
Crushed Stone | No. 3 {1 14) Ton
Crushed Stone | Screenings (Stone Ton
Dust) -
Crushed Stone | Screenfill (17 Minus) Ton
Crushed Stone | Rip Rap Ton —




Crushed Stone | %" ltem 4 Ton
Crushed Stone | Medium to Heavy Ton
Stone -
Crushed Stone | Gabion/Light Stone Ton
Fill/ Fine Stone Fill a—
Crushed Stone | Surge Stone (8” Ton
Minus) -
Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton .
#3(1%)
Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton
. _ ‘__..#.2\(374) o —— ] e I - e _— e
Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton —
#1(3/8) -
Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton
# 1A (1/4)
Gravel Commercial ltem 4 Ton
Gravel Bank Run Gravel Ton
Gravel Cobbles (Tailings) Ton
Gravel Ice Control Sand Ton
{Washed)
Calcium Liquid Calcium Gallon
Bituminous Hot Ton
X
Bituminous Cold Ton og
Mix [Yols] /@J
Sand Mix Hot Ton —
Cold Patch Bag 60 |b.
Bituminous CRS-2 Gallon Haul, Heat &
VX Applied
Bituminous CMS-2 Haul, Heat &
Mix Applied
Bituminous CRS-2 with 3% Haul, Heat &
Mix Polymer Applied




Equipment Rental Rates Based on an 8 Hour Day:

Self-Propelied CHP Spreader with Operator

Cold Mix Paver with Operator & Screener

Rubber Tired Reller with operator
Steel Wheeled Roller with operator
Transportation
A ————

Fuel Qils and Unleaded Gasoline:

Price shall be net per gallon. Contract price will be firm except that price revisions will be allowed in

accordance with the following procedures:
. All deliveries will be metered.

Bidders will base their price on the average daily New York Harbor tank consumer
posting, as published daily in the Journal of Commerce, under petroleum prices.

. Bidders shall submit a copy of the posted price with the bid.
The successful bidder, at the time of billing, shali show proper cause of escalation or

de-escalation of prices as they occur.

Notice shall include the date of change, current price, change per gallon and new

price.

FUEL OILS AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

Description Unit Delivered price over New York Harbor JOC Posting
#2 Fuel Heating Oil Gallon

Unleaded Gasoline Gallon

Ultra-low Sulfur Truck ] Gallon

Fuel {Diesel)

All bids are due on or before 12 noon on Wednesday, October 10, 2018.

NAME OF COMPANY: féo(’/%/@a ?9(/2'/’75&/7’ g_,, A

Signature of Authorized Om/

s

Title of Authorized Officer:

= F

Date: o2 s




Statement of Non-Collusion in Bids or Proposals [General Municipal Law £103-d]

By submission of this bid, each Bidder/Proposer and each person signing on behalf of any
Bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint bid, each party thereto certifies as to its own
organization, under penalty of perjury, that to the best of their knowledge and belief:

1. The prices in this bid have been arrived at independently without collusion,
consultation, communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting

competition, as to any matter relating to such prices with any other

Bidder/Proposer or with any competitor;

2. Unless otherwise required by law, the prices which have been quoted in the bid
have not been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer and will not knowingly be
disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer prior to opening directly or indirectly to any other
Bidder/Proposer or to any competitor; and

3. No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder/Proposer to induce
any other person, partnership or corporation to submit or not to submit a bid for the
purpose of restricting competition.

No bid/proposal will be considered for award nor shall any award be made where
paragraphs 1, 2, and 3 above have not been complied with; provided however, that if in
any case the bidder/proposer cannot make the foregoing certification, the
bidder/proposer shall so state and shall furnish with the bid/proposal 2 signed statement
which sets forth in detail the reasons therefor.

Where paragraphs 1, 2 and 3 above have not been complied with, the bid/proposal shall not be
considered for award nor shall any award be made unless the Town determines that such
disclosure was not made for the purpose of restricting competition.

The fact that a Bidder/Proposer: a) has published price lists, rates, or tariffs covering
items being procured, b) has informed prospective customers of proposed or pending
publication of new or revised price lists for such items, or c} has sold the same items to
other customers at the same prices being bid/proposed does not constitute, without
more, a disclosure hereunder.

l, Ayenned] S. f/é/& hereby affirm under penalty of perjury under
the Laws of the State of New York that | am authorized to provide this certification and
that the above is true and correct.

Vhclngs SheEmess o, Zoc
Name of Entity
Zlg D S ;7’% 248

w <

Age;urt/Signature . Date




BID PROPOSAL FORM
Town of Washington Highway Department & Village of Millbrook Highway Department
2018-2019 Highway Materials Bid Specifications
Bidder agrees to provide the materials indicated below at the prices set forth below, in the guantities
requested from time to time by the Highway Superintendent for Highway Department purposes.
Materials requested will be provided upan request by the Highway Superintendent. The Town is not
obligated to purchase any given quantity of materials or services from the successful bidder. Bidder may
submit & proposal for one or more of the types of items listed.

BIDDER INFORMATION

Contact Name

Joe = 5‘1(:

Company Name

/’7.'(:...1)-'4‘0 4{%'{\35, Zae. //6A /’7.‘4-7.‘5.'1[0 Eacfgy praa/ugfél

Mailing Address

The Hadvv e enter 24 [.‘onf‘}' .5'71', .o Rox S306

City, State, Zip

8,‘;’\3)\‘:.»“. ~ MY 13902

Email Address

__Jbov.: . a/a.S‘L’Q_M J'fa...L|-'Lﬁ -

Phone Number

EC7 ~382 ~ 2795%

Item Description Unit FOB Delivered Plant
Price Price Location
Soil Top Soil Ton /'/’ grﬂ/ /(/ g,ﬂ/ // 6y
' o ! f-) ¢
Crushed Stone | No. 1A (%) Ton A/ﬁ'ﬂ/ // 6 / / ,
oLl -] ’ o 8./
Crushed Stone | No. 1st (3/8) Ton
Ao B | R | Ak B
Crushed Stone | No. 2 (3/4) Ton
//a ﬁ,b/ /‘/ﬂ g-l/ /[/a B—lﬂ/
Crushed 5t No.1&2 Mixed (3/8& | T \
rushed Stane 3/(:;) ixe an M 8,/ /‘/o @./ A/o @'y
Crushed Stone | No. 3 (1 1) Ton // &y /(/ . ,
(e () .@-c/ /A (3’-/
Crushed St S ings {5t T .
rushed Stone Dri:':t?mngs one on /l/a Efﬂ/ %6.’0/ /’43{/
Crushed 5tone | Screenfill (1" Minus) Tan // B'a/ ﬂ/ 8 , \
5 B o 8.0 | oo B
Crushed Stone | Rip Rap Ton ,1/ 5y /1/ 6,/ // @'/
2 ! ] 4 f] .




Equipment Rental Rates Based on an 8 Hour Day:

Self-Propelied CHP Spreader with Operator

o BA

Cold Mix Paver with Operator & Screener

o 8l

Rubber Tired Roller with operator

o B

Steel Wheeled Roller with operator

0 B

Transportation

e Bl

Fuel Qils and Unlzaded Gasoline:

Price shail be net per gallon. Contract price will be firm except that price revisions will be allowed in

accordance with the following procedures:
. All deliveries will be metered.

Bidders will base their price on the average daily New York Harbor tank consumer
posting, as published daily in the Journal of Commerce, under petroleum prices.
. Bidders shall submit a copy of the posted price with the bid.

The successful bidder, at the time of
de-escalation of prices as they occur.

billing, shall show proper cause of escalation or

Notice shall include the date of change, current price, change per gallon and new

price.
FUEL OILS AND UNLEADED GASOLINE
Description Unit Delivered price over New York Harbor JOC Posting
#2 Fuel Heating Oil Gallon
+ , /3¢5
Unleaded Gasoline Gallon

+ . 3éo0

Ultra-low Sulfur Truck Galion
Fuel {Diesel)

+ .0975

Ali bids are due on or before 12 noon on Wednesday, October 10, 2018.

Title of Authorized Officer: __V. P, fﬂL e fg.ﬁ-_—fe -~ f/_

Date: fq//o, ZZ@IB




Statement of Non-Collusion in Bids or Proposals [General Municipal Law §103-d]

By submission of this bid, each Bidder/Proposer and each person signing on behalf of any
Bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint bid, each party thereto certifies as to its own
organization, under penalty of perjury, that to the best of their knowledge and belief:

1. The prices in this bid have been arrived at independently without collusion,
consultation, communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting

competition, as to any matter relating to such prices with any other

Bidder/Proposer or with any competitor;

2. Unless atherwise required by law, the prices which have been quoted in the bid
have not been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer and will not knowingly be
disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer prior to opening directly or indirectly to any other
Bidder/Proposer or to any competitor; and

3. No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder/Proposer to induce
any other person, partnership or corporation to submit or not to submit a bid for the
purpose of restricting competition.

No bid/proposal will be considered for award nor shall any award be made where
paragraphs 1, 2, and 3 above have not been complied with; provided however, that if in
any case the bidder/proposer cannot make the foregoing certification, the
bidder/proposer shall so state and shall furnish with the bid/proposal a signed statement
which sets forth in detail the reasons therefor.

Where paragraphs 1, 2 and 3 above have not been complied with, the hid/proposal shall not be
considered for award nor shall any award be made unless the Town determines that such
disclosure was not made for the purpose of restricting competition.

The fact that a Bidder/Proposer: a) has published price fists, rates, or tariffs covering
items being procured, b) has informed prospective customers of proposed or pending
publication of new or revised price lists for such items, or ¢) has sold the same itemns to
other customers at the same prices being bid/proposed does not constitute, without
more, a disclosure hereunder.

i //4,#/(«.) az /’fqu(c_e-.. hereby affirm under penalty of perjury under
the Laws of the State.of New York that f am authorized to provide this certification and

:’ra.b-"l"o Enecyy Pfco/u_c.‘l(?'

Lolvefoy

Date —

Hecthon) T Plachar




BiD PROPOSAL FORM
Town of Washington Highway Department & Village of Millbrook Highway Department
2018-2019 Highway Materials Bid Specifications
Bidder agrees to provide the materials indicated below at the prices set forth below, in the quantities
requested from time to time by the Highway Superintendent for Highway Department purposes.
Materials requested will be provided upon request by the Highway Superintendent. The Town is not
obligated to purchase any given quantity of materials or services from the successful bidder. Bidder may
submit a proposal for one or more of the types of items listed.

BIDDER INFORMATION

Contact Name 5‘(;_@;}—‘ Dﬂ }<‘Z’/y

Company Name 3;]{‘; 9@{/&/ g)&ms‘ C./ Jef\/;‘cé Lz
Mailing Address |z ;P L R

City, State, Zip 'P/éezjﬂf?/ E/f»téé/;/} A 5T

Email Address Uepp d’q {,:}Vaﬂgsgos @9 ma:/: o7

Phone Number SUS- 635- 8§52

Item Description Unit FOB Delivered Plant
Price Price Location
Soil Top Soil Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 1A (%) Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 15t (3/8) Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 2 (3/4) Ton

Crushed Stone | No.1 &2 Mixed {3/8& | Ton

3/4)
Crushed Stone | No. 3 (1 %) Ton
Crushed Stone | Screenings {Stone Ton
Dust)

Crushed Stone | Screenfill (17 Minus) | Ton

Crushed Stone | Rip Rap Ton




Equipment Rental Rates Based on an 8 Hour Day:

Self-Propelled CHP Spreader with Operator

Cold Mix Paver with Operator & Screener

Rubber Tired Roller with operator

Steel Wheeled Roller with operator

Transportation

Fuel Oils and Unleaded Gasoline:
Price shall be net per gallon. Contract price will be firm except that price revisions will be allowed in
accordance with the following procedures:
. All deliveries will be metered.
Bidders will base their price on the average daily New York Harbor tank consumer
posting, as published daily in the Journal of Commerce, under petroleum prices.
. Bidders shall submit a copy of the posted price with the bid.
The successful bidder, at the time of billing, shall show proper cause of escalation or
de-escalation of prices as they occur.

Notice shall include the date of change, current price, change per gallon and new

price.
FUEL OILS AND UNLEADED GASOLINE
Description Unit Delivered price over New York Harbor JOC Posting
#2 Fuel Heating Oil Gallon $ O, 1O over Gur fdué price
Unleaded Gasoline Gallon $> Oy 79 over ewr cack price
Ultra-lo.w Sulfur Truck | Galion $ 0 (3G9 over gur f\%,é/? cree
Fuel (Diesel) ,

All bids are due on or before 12 noon on Wednesday, October 10, 2018.

NAME OF COMPANY: ‘}"“ﬂ\l Dﬁf"-}’gi’-ﬂﬁ C%/ 5@-’\/‘?6@ Lac.

T2
Signature of Authorized Officer: W / Vﬂ

J
Title of Authorized Officer: /’Df;es : dle’? 7L

o<)ig

Date:




Statement of Non-Collusion in Bids or Proposals [General Municipal Law §103-d]

By submission of this bid, each Bidder/Proposer and each person signing on behalf of any
Bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint bid, each party thereto certifies as to its own
organization, under penalty of perjury, that to the best of their knowledge and belief:

1. The prices in this bid have been arrived at independently without collusion,
consultation, communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting

competition, as to any matter relating to such prices with any other

Bidder/Proposer or with any competitor;

2. Unless otherwise required by law, the prices which have been quoted in the bid
have not been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer and will not knowingly be
disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer prior to opening directly or indirectly to any other
Bidder/Proposer or to any competitor; and

3. No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder/Proposer tc induce
any other person, partnership or corporation to submit or not to submit a bid for the
purpose of restricting competition.

No bid/proposal will be considered for award nor shall any award be made where
paragraphs 1, 2, and 3 above have not been complied with; provided however, that if in
any case the bidder/proposer cannot make the foregoing certification, the
bidder/proposer shall so state and shall furnish with the bid/proposal a signed statement
which sets forth in detail the reasons therefor.

Where paragraphs 1, 2 and 3 above have not been complied with, the bid/proposal shall not be
considered for award nor shall any award be made unless the Town determines that such
disclosure was not made for the purpose of restricting competition.

The fact that a Bidder/Proposer: a) has published price lists, rates, or tariffs covering
items being procured, b} has informed prospective customers of proposed or pending
publication of new or revised price lists for such items, or ¢} has sold the same items to
other customers at the same prices being bid/proposed does not constitute, without
moere, a disclosure hereunder.

1, J_@?Q Dc /f—?/‘ hereby affirm under penalty of perjury under
the Laws of the State of New York that | am authorized to provide this certification and

that the above is true and correct.
4‘1’ S S / Sg:r‘u ce LancC.

Name of ntlw/ﬂ/%'/] /?//(/}(f

Agent Sléﬁﬂture Date




BID PROPOSAL FORM
Town of Washington Highway Department & Village of Millbrook Highway Department
2018-2019 Highway Materials Bid Specifications
Bidder agrees to provide the materials indicated below at the prices set forth below, in the quantities
requested from time to time by the Highway Superintendent for Highway Department purposes.
Materials requested will be provided upon request by the Highway Superintendent. The Town is not
obligated to purchase any given quantity of materials or services from the successful bidder. Bidder may
submit a proposal for one or more of the types of items listed.

BIDDER INFORMATION
Contact Name Kimberly A. Wilson

Company Name
pany Gorman Bros., Inc.

Mailing Address
200 Church Street

City, State, Zip Albany, NY, 12202

Email Address kwilson@gormanroads.com

Phone Number 518-462-5401
Item Description Unit FOB Delivered Plant
Price Price Location
Soil Top Soil Ton No Bid No Bid
Crushed Stone | No. 1A (%) Ton No Bid No Bid
Crushed Stone | No. 1st (3/8) Ton :
NoBid| NoBid

Crushed Stone | No. 2 (3/4) Ton No Bid No Bid
Crushed Stone | No.1& 2 Mixed {3/8 & | Ton No Bid No BRid

3/4)
Crushed Stone | No. 3 (1 %) Ton No Bid No Bid
Crushed Stone | Screenings (Stone Ton No Bid No Bid

Dust)
Crushed Stone | Screenfill (1”7 Minus) Ton No Bid No Bid
Crushed Stone | Rip Rap Ton No Bid No Bid




Gorman Bros., Inc. Pricing sheet continued

Crushed Stone | %" ltem 4 Ton
No Bid No Bid
Crushed Stone | Medium to Heavy Ton ;
No B i
Stone o Bid No Bid
Crushed Stone | Gabion/Light Stone Ton No Bid No Bid
Fill/ Fine Stone Fill
Crushed Stone | Surge Stone (8" Ton : .
No Bid
Minus) No Bid
Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton .
No Bid i
#3(1%) i No Bid
Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton . No Bid
Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton _
#1(3/8) No Bid No Bid
Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton No Bid )
Gravel Commercial ltem 4 Ton No Bid No Bid
o Bi
Gravel Bank Run Gravel Ton No Bid No Bid
Gravel Cobbles (Tailings) Ton No Bid No Bid
Gravel Ice Control Sand Ton .
No Bid No Bid
(Washed) l
Calcium Liquid Calcium Gallon No Bid $1.05 200 Church St.
' Albany, NY 12202
Bituminous Hot Ton .
Mix No Bid No Bid
Bituminous Cold Ton $95.00 $140.00 200 Church St.
Mix Albany, NY 12202
Sand Mix Hot Ton No Bid No Bid
Cold Patch Bag 60 tb. No Bid No Bid
Bituminous CRS-2 Gallon Haul, Heat & $2.44 gcf;“t?:"&i“'fzgggge Rd.
IvEix Applied )
Bituminous CMS-2 Haul, Heat & 5 Freeman's Bricge Rd.
Scotia, NY 12302
Mix Gallon Applied 52.60 o
N . B - 3 6 Freeman's Bridge Rd.
Bl’fumanous CRS-2 with 3% Gallon Haulf Heat & 42.54 eots, 1Y 12302
Mix Polymer Applied




Equipment Rental Rates Based on an 8 Hour Day:

Self-Propeled CHP Spreader with Operator $1950.00
Cold Mix Paver with Operator & Screener $3400,00
Rubber Tired Roller with operator

$1600.00
Steel Wheeled Roller with operator $1600.00

Transportation

$600.00 per move

Fuel Qils and Unleaded Gasoline:

Price shall be net per gallon. Contract price will be firm except that price revisions will be allowed in

accordance with the following procedures:
. All deliveries will be metered.,

Bidders will base their price on the average daily New York Harbor tank consumer
posting, as published daily in the Journal of Commerce, under petroleum prices.

. Bidders shall submit a copy of the posted price with the bid.

The successful bidder, at the time of
de-escalation of prices as they occur.

billing, shall show proper cause of escalation or

Notice shall include the date of change, current price, change per gallon and new

price.
FUEL OILS AND UNLEADED GASOLINE
Description Unit Delivered price over New York Harbor JOC Posting
#2 Fuel Heating Qil Gallon No Bid
Unleaded Gasoline Gallon No Bid
Ultra-low Sulfur Truck | Gallon No Bid

Fuel (Diesel)

All bids are due on or before 12 noon on Wednesday, October 10, 2018.

NAME OF COMPANY: _ Gorman Bros,, Inc.

Signature of Authorized Officer: %\\\m\ 'k \\A( —

d Officer: Vlce Premd&it}f Sales

Title of Authorlzx

Date:




Statement of Non-Collusion in Bids or Proposals [General Municipal Law §103-d]

By submission of this bid, each Bidder/Proposer and each person signing on behalf of any
Bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint bid, each party thereto certifies as to its own
organization, under penalty of perjury, that to the best of their knowledge and belief:

1. The prices in this bid have been arrived at independently without collusion,
consultation, communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting

competition, as to any matter relating to such prices with any other

Bidder/Proposer or with any competitor;

2. Unless otherwise required by law, the prices which have been quoted in the bid
have not been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer and will not knowingly be
disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer prior to opening directly or indirectly to any cther
Bidder/Proposer or to any competitor; and

3. No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder/Proposer to induce
any other person, partnership or corporation to submit or not to submit a bid for the
purpose of restricting competition.

No bid/proposal will be considered for award nor shall any award be made where
paragraphs 1, 2, and 3 above have not been complied with; provided however, that if in
any case the bidder/proposer cannot make the foregoing certification, the
bidder/proposer shall so state and shall furnish with the bid/proposal a signed statement
which sets forth in detail the reasons therefor.

Where paragraphs 1, 2 and 3 above have not been complied with, the bid/proposal shall not be
considered for award nor shall any award be made unless the Town determines that such
disclosure was not made for the purpose of restricting competition.

The fact that a Bidder/Proposer: a) has published price lists, rates, or tariffs covering
items being procured, b) has informed prospective customers of proposed or pending
publication of new or revised price lists for such items, or ¢} has sold the same items to.
other customers at the same prices being bid/proposed does not constitute, without
more, a disclosure hereunder.
I, Kimberly A. Wilson hereby affirm under penalty of perjury under
the Laws of the State of New York that | am authorized to provide this certification and
that the above is true and correct.

Gorman Bros., Inc.

R e

nt Slgn Date




BID PROPOSAL FORM

Town of Washington Highway Department & Village of Millbrook Highway Department

2018-2019 Highway Materials Bid Specifications

Bidder agrees to provide the materials indicated below at the prices set forth below, in the quantities
requested from time to time by the Highway Superintendent for Highway Department purposes.
Materials requested will be provided upon request by the Highway Superintendent. The Town is not
obligated to purchase any given quantity of materials or services from the successful bidder. Bidder may

submit a proposal for one or more of the types of items listed.

BIDDER INFORMATION

Contact Name

Company Name

-
Frank Do her 7y

Mailing Address

{ ed Wf:?/ﬁ’ //xiﬁgf Fres e
Lo fox 407

City, State, Zip

Shor muilc FY. JA5TR
7

Email Address

Phone Number

%jﬂj}{? & /i’fﬂof f/b‘/‘!/l?’;fﬂﬁ aﬂ.,;l}’ffgp‘{f/' £ opm

( Item Description Unit FOB Delivered Plant
Price Price Location
Soil Top Soil Ton — -
P 25 se B0, 00 /ﬁ/)m;é J//
Crushed Stone | No. 1A (%) Ton
Crushed Stone | No. 1st (3/8) Taon
Crushed Stone | No. 2 (3/4) Ton

Crushed Stone | No. 1 & 2 Mixed (3/8 & | Ton
3/4)

Crushed Stone | No. 3 {1 %) Ton

Crushed Stone | Screenings (Stone Ton
Dust)

Crushed Stone

Screenfill (17 Minus) Ton

Crushed Stone

Rip Rap Ton




Slen?

A

f/ﬁjj Fz i Location
Crushed Stone | %" Item 4 Ton
R3-ec | 25 60 /7,-/&4;4’
Crushed Stone | Medium to Heavy Ton
Stone
Crushed Stone | Gabion/Light Stone Ton
Fill/ Fine Stone Fill
Crushed Stone | Surge Stone (8" Ton
Minus}
| Gravel Washed Gravel Stone | Ton ) , .
#3(1%) /&, 00 R3. co Lithngs
Grave! Washed Gravel Stone | Ton .
#2 (3/4) [Piee 33 o Afhnes
Gravel Washed Gravel Stecne | Ton o L
#1(3/3) /5106 |23, 00 £y Lhnee
Grave| Washed Gravel Stone | Ton !
#1A(1/4)
Gravel Commercial ltem 4 Ton —
Loceo | 25,00 Hillin s
Gravel Bank Run Gravel Ton ) 0
/S0 | 2700 | 4w
Gravel Cobbles (Tailings) Ton ] .
/§o0 | A3 o0 bifivass
Gravel Ice Control Sand Ton Lo M jhes
(Washed) VArY: /30572 j;;,/' /:»34')'.w;
Calcium Liquid Calcium Gallon
Bituminous Hot Ton
Mix
Bituminous Cold Ton
Mix
Sand Mix Hot Ton
Cold Patch Bag 60 |b.
Bituminous CRS-2 Gallon Haul, Heat &
Mix Applied
Bituminous CMS-2 Haul, Heat &
Mix Applied
Bitumirous CRS-2 with 3% Haul, Heat &
Mix Polymer Applied




Equipment Rental Rates Based on an 8 Hour Day:

Self-Propelled CHP Spreader with Operator

Cold Mix Paver with Operator & Screener

Rubber Tired Roller with operator

Steel Wheeled Roller with operator

Transportation

Fuel Qils and Unleaded Gasoline:
Price shall be net per gallon. Contract price will be firm except that price revisions will be allowed in
accordance with the following procedures: '
. All deliveries will be metered.
Bidders will base their price on the average daily New York Harbor tark consumer
posting, as published daily in the Journal of Commerce, under petroleum prices.
. Bidders shall submit a copy of the posted price with the bid.
The successful bidder, at the time of billing, shall show proper cause of escalation or
de-escalation of prices as they occur.
Notice shall include the date of change, current price, change per gatlon and new

price.
FUEL OILS AND UNLEADED GASOLINE
Description Unit Delivered price over New York Harbor JOC Posting
#2 Fuel Heating Oil Gallon
Unleaded Gasoline Gallon

Ultra-low Sulfur Truck Gallen
Fuel (Diesel)

All bids are due on or before 12 noon on Wednesday, October 10, 2018.

NAME OF COMPANY: Ao rd wi 2 /j}ﬁ.a-;,ﬂ ghreS snce
Signature of Authorized Officer: Wﬁ}%ﬂ’%“

L /
Title of Authorized Officer: XL d=p }L

Date: /‘0/3 // g




Statement of Non-Collusion in Bids or Proposals [General Municipal Law §103-d]

By submission of this bid, each Bidder/Proposer and each person signing on behalf of any
Bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint bid, each party thereto certifies as to its own
organization, under penalty of perjury, that to the best of their knowledge and belief:

1. The prices in this bid have heen arrived at independently without collusion,
consultation, communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting

competition, as to any matter relating to such prices with any other

Bidder/Proposer or with any competitor;

2. Unless otherwise required by law, the prices which have been quoted in the bid
have not been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer and will not knowingly be
disclosed by the Bidder/Proposer prior to opening directly or indirectly to any other
Bidder/Proposer or to any competitor; and

3. No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder/Proposer to induce
any other person, partnership or corporation to submit or not to submit a bid for the
purpose of restricting competition.

No bid/proposal will be considered for award nor shall any award be made where
paragraphs 1, 2, and 3 above have not been complied with; provided however, that if in
any case the bidder/proposer cannot make the foregoing certification, the
bidder/proposer shall so state and shall furnish with the bid/proposal a signed statement
which sets forth in detail the reasons therefor.

Where paragraphs 1, 2 and 3 above have not been complied with, the bid/proposal shall not be
considered for award nor shall any award be made unless the Town determines that such
disclosure was not made for the purpose of restricting competition.

The fact that a Bidder/Proposer: a) has published price lists, rates, or tariffs covering
items being procured, b) has informed prospective customers of proposed or pending
publication of new or revised price lists for such items, or c) has sold the same items to
other customers at the same prices heing bid/proposed does not constitute, without
more, a disclosure hereunder.

ﬁ‘tﬂ K ~ ﬂa/m‘{y T hereby affirm under penalty of perjury under
the Laws of the State of New York that | am authorized to provide this certification and
that the above is true and correct. i
v’fcaz twni /ﬂf,}/f‘e/ TS iHE

Name of E%/ﬁw/w/// - o /3//,5/
Agent Slgﬁa{ué 7 Date




